
What is going on with these 
bond markets?  
Bond yields were once again in the 
speculators ‘cross-hairs’ as the 10-year US 
yield reached a session high of 2.55% which 
saw the 5-year versus 30-year yield spread 
invert. An inversion of the yield curve seen 
as a classic recessionary signal, but which 
part of the yield curve that needs to invert 
is a hotly debated matter given the longer 
term recessionary implications. 

While most commentators will agree, the 
Federal Reserve is ‘behind the curve,’ and 
the market is already pricing in a further 
200bps of hikes by calendar year end, the 
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jury is still out on whether the Fed can 
engineer a soft landing. As an fyi, since the 
10-year yield peaked, it has eased back to 
its current level of 2.46% while the German 
bund is steady at 0.58%.  

With talk of inverted curves, the Federal 
Reserve has dusted off and updated a 
paper from 2018 arguing that an inversion 
doesn’t necessarily signal anything, with 
the authors, stating “We have provided 
statistical evidence indicating that the 
perceived omniscience of the 2-10 spread 
that pervades market commentary is probably 
spurious. We argue there is no need to fear 
the 2-10 spread, or any other spread measure 
for that matter.” While it is impressive that 
the authors have maintained a degree of 
consistency in their findings, it is worth 
remembering that in August 2019 the 
US 2x10-year spread inverted, and we all 
know what happened in 2020!

Speaking of bonds, the BoJ announced it 
would be offering to purchase an unlimited 
amount of Japanese Government Bonds 
(JGB’s) at 0.25% as part of its yield curve 
control program and ongoing ‘loose’ 
monetary policy. As you may recall, the 
BoJ’s target for the 10-year JGB is around 
the 0.00% level, so with longer term JGB 
yield’s tracking higher, the BoJ are keen 
to bring the 10-year yield back into line … 
the only issue was they couldn’t find any 
offers! This triggered further selling of yen 
as the USD/JPY took out barrier options at 
122.50 and traded to a high above 125.10, 

its highest since late 2015, before it eased 

back to 123.70 The NZD also came under 
selling pressure against the USD and on 
the crosses, and while speculators tried to 
pressure the AUD lower, it is proving to be 
resilient.

Equity markets were broadly flat overnight 
although oil prices plunged -7.0% overnight 
amid fuel demand concerns in China after 
Shanghai suspended public transport and 
launched phased lockdowns to curb the 
surge of Omicron cases. Furthermore, 
it has emerged the EU Council summit 
last week failed to agree on additional 
sanctions against Russia, despite Biden’s 
presence. 

Amidst the Shanghai lockdowns, the 
authorities announced ports will remain 
open 24/7 while Chinese chipmaker,  
SMIC, announced operations will remain 
normal at its Shanghai plants.

Chris Rock? The man can take 
a punch!
In terms of actual data, US wholesale 
inventories rose 2.1% on the month, with 
the January numbers also revised up 1.1%, 
while the US goods trade deficit narr-
owed to USD106.59 billion in February 
from January’s revised all-time high of 
USD107.57 billion. 

Finally, the Australian quarterly NAB 
business survey highlighted that Q1 2022 
business confidence fell to 14 from 19.
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